From: Jeffrey Vollmer

To: Betsy Ullrich
Subject: [External_Sender] RE: RE: financial assurance DFP update needed
Date: Thursday, October 6, 2022 12:24:16 PM

No we have no intent to increase the limit at this time. Sorry for the Delay in the response. This action is
no longer needed.

Jeffrey S. Vollmer, CHP
RSO
American Radiolabeled Chemicals

From: Betsy Ullrich [mailto:Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, October 5, 2022 12:53 PM

To: Jeffrey Vollmer

Subject: RE: RE: financial assurance DFP update needed

Checking if you have a response on this issue?
Betsy

From: Betsy Ullrich

Sent: Wednesday, September 28, 2022 3:29 PM

To: Jeffrey Vollmer <jeff@arc-inc.com>

Subject: RE: RE: financial assurance DFP update needed

Mr. Vollmer,

| apologize for getting back to you so late, but | have had to do a lot of research on this very
old action. It goes back to 2007 when a request to increase the amount of carbon-14 was
submitted, doubling the amount that was on the license then, and still on the license now.
The reviewer at the time requested that you submit a new financial assurance cost estimate
for the increased amount of carbon-14, which you provided in 2008. In December 2013,
the reviewer then requested assistance from our program office in determining if the cost
estimate was sufficient; that assistance was provided in March of 2014.

Nothing has been done with this request to increase C14 and provide new financial
assurance for it since then.

You have had a large number of amendments since that time, and no changes have been
made in the amount of carbon-14. Do you still intend to increase that limit?
e If not, please withdraw the 2007 request to increase the amount of carbon-14, and |
can close this action.
e If so, please let me know and we will continue the review.

Betsy

Betsy Ullrich, Senior Health Physicist
USNRC Region |

475 Allendale Road

King of Prussia, PA 19406


mailto:jeff@arc-inc.com
mailto:Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov

610-337-5040 (office)
240-704-4575 (cell)
Elizabeth.ullrich@nrc.qov

From: Jeffrey Vollmer <jeff@arc-inc.com>

Sent: Friday, July 15, 2022 8:57 AM

To: Ullrich, Betsy <Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov>

Subject: [External_Sender] RE: financial assurance DFP update needed

See attached

From: Ullrich, Betsy [mailto:Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov]
Sent: Thursday, July 14, 2022 8:35 AM

To: jeff@arc-inc.com

Subject: financial assurance DFP update needed

Mr. Vollmer,

| am a Region | license reviewer temporarily assigned to work on some Region 3 actions.
This is a very old financial assurance action, which likely is outdated. In addition, NRC
requires that any decommissioning funding plan (DFP), that is the basis for the cost
estimate for financial assurance, be revised every 3 years and at the time of renewal. Your
DFP has not been revised since 2007.

Please review the attached letter and provide a revised DFP. If you have any questions,
feel free to reach out to me — email or cell phone is best.

Betsy

Betsy Ullrich, Senior Health Physicist
USNRC Region |

475 Allendale Road

King of Prussia, PA 19406
610-337-5040 (office)

240-704-4575 (cell)

Elizabeth.ullrich@nrc.gov
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