From: Seeley, Shawn

To: Jose L. Rodriguez Collazo

Cc: Jossie Rodriguez Rodriguez; Nguyen, Jan; Margarita Palacios
Subject: NRC fees & License amendment

Date: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 8:42:00 AM
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Mr. Rodriguez,

| promised you some information regarding your license and an option for your current
situation. It appears you are in a holding pattern until you can find a nuclear medicine
technologist and get your equipment repaired. Therefore, it makes sense to move into a
“Possession only-Standby License” until such time as you can get back up and running.
The annual fee for this is currently $9,900.00, which is less than what you are currently
being charged.

In order to make this change, please submit an amendment request with the following
information:

1. Please request to move to a “possession only — standby” program code.
2. Please identify all licensed material to be placed in storage. For each sealed source or device
containing a sealed source, identify (if possible) the source and device by manufacturer, model
number, serial number, isotope, activity, date of assay, and date of last leak test.
3. Please include a clear commitment not to use the licensed material for any purpose, pending
disposal or authorization to restart (as applicable).
4. Please include a physical description of the facilities where the material will be stored if it is
different from storage facilities already approved in the license. Any planned facility changes have
been identified, and provisions to maintain exposures as low as reasonably achievable are adequate.
5. Please identify the individual who will be responsible for maintaining control of the licensed
material while it is in storage. The individual’s training and experience, as described in the
individual’s resume, are adequate. The necessary qualifications will vary depending on the material
being stored. In general, the responsible individual should have a working knowledge of basic
radiation safety practices and the regulatory requirements associated with the material being
stored.
6. Please include an acceptable accountability program for assuring that the licensed material
remains in secure storage and is not used (inventoried at least annually). The program provides
reasonable assurance that the licensee will maintain security.
7. Please include all planned changes to limit/decrease the licensee’s radiation safety program, as a
result of placing the licensed material in storage. These changes may include, but are not limited to,
the following:

a. Dosimetry services

b. Worker training programs

c. Instrument calibration services

d. Inventories

e. Internal audits

f. Maintenance and visual inspection of equipment and facilities

g. Maintenance of records
8. Please include, if applicable, a commitment to leak test sealed sources and devices containing
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José Luis Rodriguez, MHSA

Vice President & Executive Director
Administration

Office: (787)727-1000, Ext. 4141
Irodriquez@sanjorgepr.com

Cuidamos o familia con amor.





sealed sources at least once every 10 years and within 6 months before use or transfer to an
authorized recipient.

| am on a rotation until November 19, 2022. | have copied Ms. Jan Nguyen on this email as
she will be the one who can help you if you have additional questions. | will still answer
your questions if you contact me, but wanted you to realize there may be a delay in getting
back to you.

Hope all else is well.

Let us know if you have any questions.

Shawn

Stawn W. Seeley

Shawn W. Seeley

Acting Regional State Agreements Officer
USNRC

2100 Renaissance Boulevard, Suite 100
King of Prussia, PA 19406-2713
610-337-5102 (0); 610-337-5269 (f)
Shawn.seeley@nrc.gov

From: Jose L. Rodriguez Collazo <jlrodriguez@sanjorgepr.com>

Sent: Thursday, July 28, 2022 3:31 PM

To: Seeley, Shawn <Shawn.Seeley@nrc.gov>; Aridi, Nadine <Nadine.Aridi@nrc.gov>
Cc: Jossie Rodriguez Rodriguez <jossier@sanjorgepr.com>

Subject: [External_Sender] RE: RE: NRC fees

Shawn, THANK YOU VERY MUCH

Administration
Office: (787)727-1000, Ext. 4141
:!Q.Bﬂ llrodriguez@sanjorgepr.com

friidamet fru frmidia comn amoy.

o José Luis Rodriguez, MHSA
x Vice President & Executive Director

From: Seeley, Shawn <Shawn.Seeley@nrc.gov>
Sent: Monday, July 25, 2022 1:08 PM
To: Aridi, Nadine <Nadine.Aridi@nrc.gov>; Jose L. Rodriguez Collazo <jlrodriguez@sanjorgepr.com>
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Cc: Jossie Rodriguez Rodriguez <jossier@sanjorgepr.com>
Subject: RE: RE: NRC fees

Jose, please contact me next week. There may be another licensing option for you. Ill
send you the info next week. We can look at putting your license into a “storage only”
category via the amendment process. I'll research what the fee is for that category.

Shawn

Stawn W. Seeley

Shawn W. Seeley, Health Physicist
USNRC

2100 Renaissance Boulevard, Suite 100
King of Prussia, PA 19406-2713
610-337-5102 (0); 610-337-5269 (f)
Shawn.seeley@nrc.gov

From: Aridi, Nadine <Nadine.Aridi@nrc.gov>

Sent: Monday, July 25, 2022 12:19 PM

To: Jose L. Rodriguez Collazo <jlrodriguez@sanjorgepr.com>

Cc: Jossie Rodriguez Rodriguez <jossier@sanjorgepr.com>; Wanda |. Marrero Quiles
<wmarrero@sanjorgepr.com>; Fees_Regions <Fees_Regions@nrc.gov>; SmallEntity Resource

<SmallEntity.Resource@nrc.gov>; Seeley, Shawn <Shawn.Seeley@nrc.gov>
Subject: RE: RE: NRC fees

Good Afternoon Jose,

Thanks for taking the time to speak with me last Thursday. As discussed, the Small Entity form
request received will be disregarded due to ineligibility.

Invoice, LFB 22-2243, is due in full amount in addition to the interest, penalty and admin charges
accrued so far. As of today, $4900.00 has been paid towards the invoice leaving the outstanding
balance owed as $11,942.00: $11,900.00 (principal) and $42.00 (Interest, penalty and admin
charges). Attached are a copy of the invoice (the copy of the invoice shows only the total principal
amount and does not include payments applied, interest, admin charges and penalty amounts), and
eBilling sign-up information. Please note that interest, admin charges and penalty fees will continue
to accrue until invoice is paid in full.

Also, you mentioned that you have licensing questions, please feel free to reach out to Shawn Seely,
included is Shawn Seely’s email address (Shawn.Seeley@nrc.gov) on this email for reference.

If you have questions related to the attached invoices or the license fees, please contact me
(Fees_regions(@nrc.gov) or the License Fee Help Desk at 301-415-7554. Below, please find
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helpful links related to payment methods.

Acceptable Payment Methods - https://www.nrc.gov/docs/ML1916/ML19163A244.pdf

Authorization for Payment by Credit Card - https://www.nrc.gov/reading-rm/doc-
collections/forms/nrc629.pdf

Thanks,
Nadine

From: Aridi, Nadine

Sent: Tuesday, July 12, 2022 3:09 PM

To: Jose L. Rodriguez Collazo <jlrodriguez@sanjorgepr.com>; Seeley, Shawn
<Shawn.Seeley@nrc.gov>

Cc: Jossie Rodriguez Rodriguez <jossier@sanjorgepr.com>; Wanda I. Marrero Quiles
<wmarrero@sanjorgepr.com>; Fees_Regions <Fees_Regions@nrc.gov>; SmallEntity Resource
<SmallEntity.Resource@nrc.gov>

Subject: RE: RE: NRC fees

Good Afternoon Jose,

| called the office today to check if there is any status update but | learned that you are out of the
office this week so | hope you are enjoying your time off!

| spoke to Shawn regarding the program code that is currently assigned to license 52-25379-01,
docket 3034319 and | was advised that this is the correct program code to be used.

At this point, the invoice, LFB 22-2243, is due in full amount in addition to the interest, penalty and
admin charges accrued so far. Attached are a copy of the invoice (the copy of the invoice shows only
principal amount and does not include interest, admin charges and penalty amounts), Small Entity
Certification Form and eBilling sign-up information. Please note that interest, admin charges and
penalty fees will continue to accrue until invoice is paid in full.

Please let me know if you have any questions or additional assistance is needed.

Thanks,
Nadine

From: Aridi, Nadine
Sent: Thursday, June 30, 2022 3:31 PM
To: Jose L. Rodriguez Collazo <jlrodriguez@sanjorgepr.com>; Seeley, Shawn

<Shawn.Seeley@nrc.gov>
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Cc: Jossie Rodriguez Rodriguez <jossier@sanjorgepr.com>; Wanda |. Marrero Quiles
<wmarrero@sanjorgepr.com>; Fees_Regions <Fees_Regions@nrc.gov>; SmallEntity Resource

<SmallEntity.Resource@nrc.gov>
Subject: RE: RE: NRC fees

Good Afternoon Jose,

Thank you for taking the time to speak with me today. As discussed during our conversation, please
find copies of the work paper for the FY 2021 and FY 2022 Final Fee Rule attached. These documents
can be found on NRC public site as well.

Also, attached is the Small Entity Certification form, NRC Form 526. Please review to determine if
you qualify. If you think you qualify, the form should be filled out completely and sent to SmallEntity
Resource Team at SmallEntity.Resource@nrc.gov after making a payment of at least the small entity
fee tier amount that you think you qualify for. After payment and complete Small Entity Certification
form are received, the Small Entity Team will review the request for invoice LFB 22-2243 to
determine if you qualify. If approved, the invoice will be closed under the Small Entity fee applied
for. If denied, you will be responsible for the total invoice amount including Interest, penalty and
admin charges accrued at that time.

Regarding whether the program code 02120 that is currently listed under license 52-25379-01,
docket 3034319, is the correct program code being used, | would defer your question to Region |
Licensing Team.

@Seeley, Shawn — Please can you advise who Jose can reach out to in Region | to discuss the
program code listed under his license?

Lastly, | would like to inform you of our eBilling system. eBilling is a complementary web-based
application available for use by our Licensees and provides immediate delivery of NRC invoices,
customizable email notifications, the capability to view and analyze invoice details, and the
convenience to access Treasury systems to pay invoices. Please see the attached brochure which
contains sign-up instructions along with eBilling screenshots and available functionality.

You can also find the eBilling brochure on the NRC’s public webpage (www.nrc.gov) by selecting the
“eBilling” icon on the right side of the page.

Hope this helps and please feel free to contact us if you have further questions.

Thanks,
Nadine

From: Jose L. Rodriguez Collazo <jlrodriguez@sanjorgepr.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 29, 2022 3:39 PM

To: Aridi, Nadine <Nadine.Aridi@nrc.gov>

Cc: Jossie Rodriguez Rodriguez <jossier@sanjorgepr.com>; Wanda I. Marrero Quiles
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<wmarrero@sanjorgepr.com>; Fees Regions <Eees_Regions@nrc.gov>
Subject: [External_Sender] RE: NRC fees

Thank you Nadine

Can you call me? It is a little bit confusing how to calculate our fees per the Federal Register. | really
don t understand how you calculate our fees.

Question: the dollar number for small companies is based on only nuclear volume or it is the total
volume of the hospital?

Thank youl!

Administration
Office: (787)727-1000, Ext. 4141
JORG E [lrodriguez@sanjorgepr.com

o José Luis Rodriguez, MHSA
x Vice President & Executive Director

CHILBREN L WoMIN'L
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From: Aridi, Nadine <Nadine.Aridi@nrc.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, June 29, 2022 9:10 AM

To: Jose L. Rodriguez Collazo <jlrodriguez(@sanjorgepr.com>

Cc: Jossie Rodriguez Rodriguez <jossier@sanjorgepr.com>; Wanda I. Marrero Quiles

<wmarrero@sanjorgepr.com>; Fees Regions <Eees_Regions@nrc.gov>
Subject: RE: NRC fees

Good Morning Jose,

Thank you for reaching out to the U.S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission (NRC) regarding 2022 NRC
fees. | apologize for missing your call yesterday. If preferred, | can call you back at 12 pm EST today.
Currently program code 02120 which is under fee category 7C is assigned to Docket

03034319/License Number 52-25379-01. Per § 171.16 of Title 10 of the Code of Federal Regulations
(10 CER), the annual fee for fee category 7C is $16,800.

The NRC license fees are assessed and can change from year-to-year. The annual fees are published
as a Proposed and Final Rulemaking in the Federal Register each year. The public can review and
comment on proposed fees before they are published as final and become effective. The annual

fees are published in our regulations at § 171.16 of Title 10 of the Code of Federal Regulations (10
CER).

Hope this helps and please let me know if additional assistance is needed.

Thanks,
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Nadine

From: Jose L. Rodriguez Collazo <jlrodriguez@sanjorgepr.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 28, 2022 12:05 PM

To: Aridi, Nadine <Nadine Aridi@nrc.gov>

Cc: Jossie Rodriguez Rodriguez <jossier@sanjorgepr.com>; Wanda I. Marrero Quiles

<wmarrero@sanjorgepr.com>
Subject: [External_Sender] NRC fees

Good morning, Nadine

We write you regarding the 2022 NRC fees for our facility, San Jorge Children & Women’s Hospital
(SCWH). Docket number 03034319.

This year’s fees are $16,800. We believe that amount was based on past volume we used to have.
Since the pandemic started, the nuclear medicine department have been providing very limited
services. Due to our decrease in volume, we would like you to recalculate our new fees based on
actual volume. We should be now in the lowest tier, meaning a lower fee.

| can be reached at 787-727-1000 ext. 4141 or 787-727-0940.

Thank you for the attention to this matter.

Cordially,

Administration
Office; (787)727-1000, Ext. 4141
JORG [Irodriguez@sanjorgepr.com

o José Luis Rodriguez, MHSA
x Vice President & Executive Director

CHILBREN L WoMIN'L

Crddeiad- fie framclia cove amor

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail message, including attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential
and/or protected health information. Under the Federal Law (HIPAA), the intended recipient is obligated to keep this information secure and
confidential. Any disclosure to third parties without authorization from the member or as permitted by law is prohibited and punishable under Federal

Law. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

NOTA DE CONFIDENCIALIDAD: Este mensaje incluyendo cualquier anejo es para uso exclusivo del (los) destinatario (s) y puede incluir informacion
confidencial y/o informacion de salud protegida. La Ley Federal (HIPAA) establece que el destinatario esta obligado a mantener la informacion
confidencial y segura. HIPAA prohibe y castiga cualquier divulgacion a terceras personas sin autorizacion del afiliado o permitido por ley. Si usted no es

el destinatario, redirija este mensaje al remitente, y destruya cualquier copia existente del mensaje original.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail message, including attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential
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