
From: Ullrich, Betsy
To: Ragland, Randolph; R1LAT RESOURCE; R1DNMSMAIL RESOURCE; R1eDOCS Resource
Cc: Junod, Rebecca; Walt, Geralyn; Pfingsten, Jonathan; Linde, Amy
Subject: RE: Incoming License Termination Action
Date: Wednesday, March 24, 2021 6:04:31 AM
Attachments: image001.png

Lyn/Becky/Amy,
 
We are looking for this action that was forwarded by Randy on March 11.  I don’t see it
listed in WBL or ADAMS yet.  Is this in the incoming licensing process anywhere?
 
Thanks,
Betsy
 
From: Ragland, Randolph <Randolph.Ragland@nrc.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, March 11, 2021 1:02 PM
To: R1LAT RESOURCE <R1LAT.RESOURCE@nrc.gov>; Ullrich, Betsy <Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov>;
R1DNMSMAIL RESOURCE <R1DNMSMAIL.RESOURCE@nrc.gov>; R1eDOCS Resource
<R1eDOCS.Resource@nrc.gov>
Subject: Incoming License Termination Action
 

Docket No. 030-15231
06-06284-02
 
The Lane Construction Corporation
 
 
Regards,
 
 
 
 
Randolph C. Ragland, Jr., CHP
Senior Health Physicist
Division of Nuclear Materials Safety
NRC Region I
2100 Renaissance Boulevard, Suite 100
King of Prussia, PA 19426
(610) 337-5083 (office)
(610) 310-7799 (cell)
(610) 337-5269 (fax)

 
From: White, Fredrick D. <FDWhite@laneconstruct.com> 
Sent: Thursday, March 11, 2021 10:01 AM

mailto:Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov
mailto:Randolph.Ragland@nrc.gov
mailto:R1LAT.RESOURCE@nrc.gov
mailto:R1DNMSMAIL.RESOURCE@nrc.gov
mailto:R1eDOCS.Resource@nrc.gov
mailto:Rebecca.Junod@nrc.gov
mailto:Geralyn.Walt@nrc.gov
mailto:Jonathan.Pfingsten@nrc.gov
mailto:Amy.Linde@nrc.gov
mailto:FDWhite@laneconstruct.com

NE 7
LA





To: Ragland, Randolph <Randolph.Ragland@nrc.gov>
Cc: Riner, Kelly <Kelly.Riner@nrc.gov>; Ullrich, Betsy <Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov>; Sylvia, Meagan R.
<MRSylvia@laneconstruct.com>
Subject: [External_Sender] RE: RE: Lane Construction Radioactive Material License
 
Mr. Ragland,
 
Please see the attached NRC Form 314 to officially request termination for Lane’s Radioactive
Material License (06-06284-02) effective 3/23/2021. I will forward the disposal letter from Troxler
Labs immediately upon receipt. Please let me know if you have any questions.
 
Sincerely,
 

Fred White | Corporate Quality Manager
The Lane Construction Corporation
 
*: fdwhite@laneconstruct.com | Ë: 704.309.1138
“The first step of “Quality” is having pride in your work”
 

From: Ragland, Randolph <Randolph.Ragland@nrc.gov> 
Sent: Wednesday, March 10, 2021 1:00 PM
To: White, Fredrick D. <FDWhite@laneconstruct.com>
Cc: Riner, Kelly <Kelly.Riner@nrc.gov>; Ullrich, Betsy <Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov>
Subject: RE: RE: Lane Construction Radioactive Material License
 

Mr. White,
 
The 50% refund is a policy of the fees department so I would rather they
confirm that. 
 
With respect to your license termination request, the sooner you send
that in the better.  It will get into our system and you can send
confirmation of the disposal later. 
 
Also, expedited processing cannot be counted on.
 
Again, we normally need 90 days for this type of action.
 
Regards,
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Randolph C. Ragland, Jr., CHP
Senior Health Physicist
Division of Nuclear Materials Safety
NRC Region I
2100 Renaissance Boulevard, Suite 100
King of Prussia, PA 19426
(610) 337-5083 (office)
(610) 310-7799 (cell)
(610) 337-5269 (fax)

 
From: White, Fredrick D. <FDWhite@laneconstruct.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, March 10, 2021 11:58 AM
To: Ragland, Randolph <Randolph.Ragland@nrc.gov>
Cc: Sylvia, Meagan R. <MRSylvia@laneconstruct.com>; Riner, Kelly <Kelly.Riner@nrc.gov>
Subject: [External_Sender] RE: Lane Construction Radioactive Material License
 
Mr. Ragland,
 

Thank you for the information. Our last gauge will be shipped to Troxler on the 23rd of this month for
disposal. I will submit the paperwork as soon as Troxler confirms receipt of the device and request
the expedited process. That will allow us to receive back 50% of the license fee since the request was

submitted before March 30th correct?  
 

Fred White | Corporate Quality Manager
The Lane Construction Corporation
 
*: fdwhite@laneconstruct.com | Ë: 704.309.1138
“The first step of “Quality” is having pride in your work”
 

From: Ragland, Randolph <Randolph.Ragland@nrc.gov> 
Sent: Wednesday, March 10, 2021 11:11 AM
To: White, Fredrick D. <FDWhite@laneconstruct.com>
Cc: Sylvia, Meagan R. <MRSylvia@laneconstruct.com>; Riner, Kelly <Kelly.Riner@nrc.gov>
Subject: RE: Lane Construction Radioactive Material License
 

Mr. White,
 
The link to NRC Form 314 is listed near the bottom of this email.
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Complete that and submit it to, I guess me, and request license
termination.
 
Also, because we have committed to processing license amendments
including license terminations within 90 days, you will need to request
an expedited processing of your requested license termination.
 
 
 
Regards,
 
 
 
 
Randolph C. Ragland, Jr., CHP
Senior Health Physicist
Division of Nuclear Materials Safety
NRC Region I
2100 Renaissance Boulevard, Suite 100
King of Prussia, PA 19426
(610) 337-5083 (office)
(610) 310-7799 (cell)
(610) 337-5269 (fax)

 
From: Riner, Kelly <Kelly.Riner@nrc.gov> 
Sent: Wednesday, March 10, 2021 11:05 AM
To: White, Fredrick D. <FDWhite@laneconstruct.com>
Cc: Sylvia, Meagan R. <MRSylvia@laneconstruct.com>; Ragland, Randolph
<Randolph.Ragland@nrc.gov>
Subject: RE: Lane Construction Radioactive Material License
 
I would suggest putting the request in writing and submit via email to Mr. Ragland.  This
would probably be the quickest way since we are all still working remotely due to COVID.  I
have copied Mr. Ragland on this email.
 
Thanks,
 
Kelly Riner 
Financial Management Analyst
Fee Billing Team
Labor Administration and Fee Billing Branch
Office of the Chief Financial Officer
Nuclear Regulatory Commission
 

Ask me about eBilling!
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Kelly.riner@nrc.gov
(301) 415-6246 (office)
(304) 725-6712 (alternative work location)
 

 
From: White, Fredrick D. <FDWhite@laneconstruct.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, March 09, 2021 2:51 PM
To: Riner, Kelly <Kelly.Riner@nrc.gov>
Cc: Sylvia, Meagan R. <MRSylvia@laneconstruct.com>
Subject: [External_Sender] Lane Construction Radioactive Material License
 
Hello Kelly,
 
We will be sending our last nuclear gauge to Troxler on 3/23 for disposal and would like to cancel

our Corporate Radioactive Material license before the March 31st deadline. What exactly would you
need to make sure that process is complete?
 
Thanks  
 

Fred White | Corporate Quality Manager
The Lane Construction Corporation
 
*: fdwhite@laneconstruct.com | Ë: 704.309.1138
“The first step of “Quality” is having pride in your work”
 

From: Riner, Kelly <Kelly.Riner@nrc.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 2, 2020 4:16 PM
To: White, Fredrick D. <FDWhite@laneconstruct.com>
Cc: Sylvia, Meagan R. <MRSylvia@laneconstruct.com>
Subject: RE: FW: RE: Number of Gauges
 
Good afternoon Mr. White,
 
The information provided by Mr. Ragland is correct.  If a termination request is received
between Oct. 1 and March 31 of any given fiscal year, your fee would be 50% prorated.  If
the termination comes in between Apr. 1 and Sept. 30, the fee is due in full.  I hope this
helps!
 
Thanks,
 
Kelly Riner 
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Financial Management Analyst
Fee Billing Team
Labor Administration and Fee Billing Branch
Office of the Chief Financial Officer
Nuclear Regulatory Commission
 

Ask me about eBilling!
 
Kelly.riner@nrc.gov
(301) 415-6246 (office)
(304) 725-6712 (alternative work location)
 

 
From: White, Fredrick D. <FDWhite@laneconstruct.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 02, 2020 3:17 PM
To: Riner, Kelly <Kelly.Riner@nrc.gov>
Cc: Sylvia, Meagan R. <MRSylvia@laneconstruct.com>
Subject: [External_Sender] FW: RE: Number of Gauges
 
Good afternoon Kelly,
 
Can you please confirm if the information provided by Randolph below is correct?
 
Thanks
 

Fred White | Corporate Quality Manager
The Lane Construction Corporation
 
*: fdwhite@laneconstruct.com | Ë: 704.309.1138
“The first step of “Quality” is having pride in your work”
 

From: Ragland, Randolph <Randolph.Ragland@nrc.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 2, 2020 3:13 PM
To: White, Fredrick D. <FDWhite@laneconstruct.com>
Subject: RE: RE: Number of Gauges
 
Mr. White,
 
If you cancel before March 31, 2020, you could have gotten 50% of your fees back.  I believe your
fees run through September 2020, and are due again in October 2020.  However, I am part of the
technical staff and they like keeping the technical staff separated from fee conversations.  You can
contact the individual listed below to confirm that information.
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Kelly Riner 
Financial Management Analyst
Fee Billing Team
Labor Administration and Fee Billing Branch
Office of the Chief Financial Officer
Nuclear Regulatory Commission
 
Ask me about eBilling!
 
Kelly.riner@nrc.gov
(301) 415-6246 (office)
(304) 725-6712 (alternative work location)
 
With regard to license termination, you can send a letter to NRC by mail or email to a staff member
(just confirm that received it), and make you provide the information required my NRC Form 314. 
https://www.nrc.gov/reading-rm/doc-collections/forms/nrc314info.html
 
You would make sure you do this before the end of the license fiscal year (which I believe is
September 30, 2020.  Then we would just process your license termination.
 
 
 
 
Regards,
 
 
 
 
Randolph C. Ragland, Jr., CHP
Senior Health Physicist
Division of Nuclear Materials Safety
NRC Region I
2100 Renaissance Boulevard, Suite 100
King of Prussia, PA 19426
(610) 337-5083 (office)
(610) 310-7799 (cell)
(610) 337-5269 (fax)
 

From: White, Fredrick D. <FDWhite@laneconstruct.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 2, 2020 3:02 PM
To: Ragland, Randolph <Randolph.Ragland@nrc.gov>
Cc: Sylvia, Meagan R. <MRSylvia@laneconstruct.com>
Subject: [External_Sender] RE: Number of Gauges
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Hello Randy,
 
I have a couple quick questions about our attached corporate license. If we cancel it, when will the
annual fee stop and what is the process to do so?
 
Thanks
 

Fred White | Corporate Quality Manager
The Lane Construction Corporation
 
*: fdwhite@laneconstruct.com | Ë: 704.309.1138
“The first step of “Quality” is having pride in your work”
 

From: Ragland, Randolph <Randolph.Ragland@nrc.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 1:28 PM
To: White, Fredrick D. <FDWhite@laneconstruct.com>
Subject: Number of Gauges
 
Fred White
Corporate Quality Manager
Lane Construction Company
 
Mr. White,
 
Do you want me to decrease your authorized possession limit to one single Troxler Model 3440
gauge, or do you want some flexibility if you decide to purchase additional gauges.
 
Either way is OK, because there are no additional charges for license amendments. 
 
 
 
Regards,
 
 
 
 
Randolph C. Ragland, Jr., CHP
Senior Health Physicist
Division of Nuclear Materials Safety
NRC Region I
2100 Renaissance Boulevard, Suite 100
King of Prussia, PA 19426
(610) 337-5083 (office)
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(610) 310-7799 (cell)
(610) 337-5269 (fax)
 
Note: This message is for the named person's use only. It may contain confidential, proprietary or
legally privileged information. No confidentiality or privilege is waived or lost by any miss-
transmission. If you receive this message in error, please immediately delete it and all copies of it
from your system, destroy any hard copies of it and notify the sender. You must not, directly or
indirectly, use, disclose, distribute, print, or copy any part of this message if you are not the intended
recipient. LANE INDUSTRIES and any of its subsidiaries each reserve the right to monitor all e-mail
communications through its networks. Any views expressed in this message are those of the
individual sender, except where the message states otherwise and the sender is authorized to state
them to be the views of any such entity. Thank You.


