ot Ltetaeser ¥ rL el et OF 1rus

AV IDMENT OF SOLICITATION/WMODIFICATION OF CONTRACT 1 2
PR T e 'zw};atiﬁ'uic ATi0W N0, PP OTECTVIVE DATE  Ja MEGUISITION UM HAST GG NO. 15 1Rt €T NG 1T erplicoble)
Six (6 RES-81-195-03 dtd 11/19 BJ
& sULD BY b T T S A i é/-?o/zj 17 ADMINISTERLD BY (If other fo.f-{u;/'m e) - o . 1
CODE Wl N W y .- coor] T =Y
*U.S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission
Division of Contracts
Washington, DC 20555
& NAME AND ADDRESS OF CONTRACTOR (No., sireel. county, Slatr oné ZIF Code) @) |3A AMENDME NT OF SOLICITATION ~NO.

St. Louis University
221 North Grand Boulevard
St. Louis, MO 63103

|SB DATED (SEE ITEM 11)

10A MODIF ICATION OF CONTRACT/ORDER
X NRC-04-81-195-03

108 DATLD (SEE ITEM 13)

€ODE ~ JFACILITY CODE
1. THISITEM ONLY APPLIES TO AMENDMENTS OF SCL OCITATISN%

G The above numibered solicitation is amendad as se1 forth in [vem 14 The houwr and dare specified for receipt of Offers D 1s exienced D s NO1 ex-
wnded

Ofters must acknowiedge receipt of this amendment prior 10 the hour and cate specified in the solicilation or es amended, by one of the foliowing methods.

{a) By completing ltems B and 15_and returning __ copies of the amendment. (b) By acknowledging receipt of this smendmen) on each copy of the offer
submined, or (c) By separate lener or t1elegram which includes a reference 10 the solicitalion and amendment numbers FAILURE OF YOUR ACKNOWLEDG-
MENT 1O BE RECEIVED AT THE PLACE DESIGNATED FOR THE RECEIPT OF OFFERS PRIOR TO THE HOUR AND DATE SPECIFIED MAY RESULT

IN REJECTION OF YOUR OFFER. I by virtue of this amenament you Oesire 10 change an offer aeady subminied such change may be made by telegram or
letier  provsdeo each telegram. of leTier makes reference 10 the soliciianon and this amendment, and 1s receved DrHoT 10 the cuening houi and Cate speciled

12 ACCOUNTING AND APPE OPRIATION DATA (If required) 3

13 THIS ITEM APPLIES ONLY TO MODIFICATIONS OF CONTRACTS/ORDERS,
IT MODIFIES THE CONTRACT/ORDER NO AS DESCRIBED IN ITEM 14

v' A THIS CHANGE ORDE R 1S ISSUED PURSUANT TO: (Spectfy cuthority) THE CHANGES SET FORTH IN ITEM 14 ARE MADE IN THE CON
Yl TRACT ORDER NO IN ITEM 10A

-—

B THE ABOVE NUMBERED CONTRACT/ORDER 1S MODIFIED TO REFLECT THE ADMINISTRATIVE CHANGES (such as chanpes in paying office,
eppropr ~iwn daie, etc JSET FORTH IN ITEM 14 PURSUANT TO THE AUTHORITY OF FAR 431 103(D)

IR

IC. THIL SUPPLEMENTAL AGRITMINT IS ENTERED INTO PURSUANT 10 AUTHORITY OF

x| 41 U.s.C. 252(c)(10) y:@xa 850530 M. £ ., P W0
O. 0OV et R Succi]y type ©f mod.licolion en€ cuthority)
' c-04-81-195 PDR

2 .
E. IMPORTANT: Conuactor D 15 NOT, [;] 15 required 10 sign this document and return ___________ copses 10 the issuing office.
34 DESCRIFPIION OF AMENOMENT /MODIFICATION (Organiied by UCT seclion he odings, including soliciiglion/contract sutyec! matier where feaslbie.)

A. In ARTICLE I - STATEMENT OF WORK the following work is added in accordance with the
contractor's proposal entitled "Seismological Investigation of the Earthquakes in
the New Madrid Seismic Zone and Seismological Investigation of the Northeastern
Extent of the New Madrid Seismic Zone," dated April 2, 1985. Specifically, the
contractor shall continue to: . -

a) Continue the operation of, maintenance of and data analysis from the local
networks. The direct product of this effort consists of quarterly seismic
bulletins submitted to the NRC which provide earthquake ceismic phase «
readings, earthquake locations, and operational status of the network.

Ercep) 2y Drovided herein, all 1e:my ano conditions of the document reterenced In 1tem SA or J0A as herstolore changed, remalny unchanged and In full torce
ang etiect

I5A. NAME AND TITLE OF SIGNE R (Type or print)

TI6A. NAME AND TITLE OF CONTRACTING OF FICER (Type or pnnt)

William Stauder, S.J., University Paul J. Edgeworth

Wft)h#gglsfb!}‘.%?%ﬂi!&[!}_ﬁl T TTasc pAave i.TdN?B“)(B?s?AYL;]f'TE' W e 16C DATE SIGNED
[ 77299, N R A N ) > e G |

(Suncture of prison eutho:sed to sifn) s reture ontracting Offwer) ) S 30 é
" vV o= -
NSN 754001-1%7 8070 30108 STANDARD FORM (R L1e 13)




Modification No. 6
Contract No. NRC-04-81-195-03
Page 2 of 2

-

b) Continue to incorporate readings from nearby networks supported
by the U.S. NRC into our bulletins and data base in order to
maintain a stable regional catalog of seismicity and to make
the most complete catalog possible accessible to the U.S. NRC.

c) Continue to use the seismic data S0 acquired to perform topical
research of interest to both the site safety research and
Ticensing activities of the NRC.

d) Complete supplementing the existing telemetered seismic network
by the installation of a broadband, digital, high dynamic
range system consisting of two field acquisition units. Each
unit consists of three component, continuous data acquisition
units. The purpose of the system is to provide the seismic
data required to learn more about the earthquake than just its
location parameters. Precise focal depth, focal mechanism,
and source parameters are to be determined. The system is
designed for on scale recordings of larger earthquakes which
cannot be so recorded on present instrumentation.

ARTICLE II - PERIOD OF PERFORMANCE is deleted in its entirety and a
new ARTICLE II is added as follows:

“ARTICLE II - PERIOD OF PERFORMANCE

The period of performance under this contract shall commence on
September 30, 1981 and expire on September 29, 1986."

In ARTICLE III - CONSIDERATION the following changes are made:

(1) In ARTICLE :II (A)(1) delete the amount "$570,000.00" and
insert in lieu thereof the amount of “$720,000.00."

(2) In ARTICLE III (A)(2) delete the amount "$570,000.00" and
insert "$720,000.00."

Change the B&R No. 60-19-01-04 as stated in block no. 12, "Accounting
and Appropriation Data," is revised to read "B&R No. 601950".



