_(I:_ourtemanche, Steven

From: Gibbs, Kevin C. <kevingibbs@schulzelectric.com>

Sent: Friday, April 26, 2019 2:27 PM

To: Courtemanche, Steven

Cc: Burritt, Arthur

Subject: [External_Sender] RE: DCE for Timken Motor and Crane Services, LLC.

.Hello Mr. Courtemanche, O é—- 3 /O 45" O /
1 appreciate your input pertaining to our DCE. O 3 O 3 é ? 3 /

Currently, I am working on answering the questions you provided in the last email. { should have that
completed for you sometime next week.

Thank you,

Kevin Gibbs | Radiation Safety Officer | +1 203 859 7418 desk | +1 203 859 4092 cell
Timken Motor & Crane Srvcs LLC | Mail Code:"NHA-1 | 30 Gando Drive | New Haven, Connecticut 06513 | Stronger. By Design.

TIMKEN

From: Courtemanche, Steven [mailto:Steven.Courtemanche@nrc.gov]
Sent: Monday, April 22, 2019 12:02 PM

To: Gibbs, Kevin C.

Cc: Burritt, Arthur

Subject: [EXT] RE: DCE for Timken Motor and Crane Services, LLC.

Dear Mr. Gibbs:

As your contractor implied, there is no reason to do a complete DFP but you do have to account for more than
just inflation. A few questions you need to answer:

1. Is your program handling more or less material than it was three years ago?

2. Have you generated and storing more waste than three years ago?

3. Are additional areas of your facility contaminated or has contamination affected areas outside your
facility?

4. Has your radioactive materials waste vendor raised his rates more than the rate of inflation?

5. Have labor rates, according to the BSL charts for technicians, Health Physicists, et al. outpaced
inflation?

If the answer to those questions is “No” and your program has not decreased in size, then the assumption that
raising your financial assurance by the rate of inflation is correct. If any of the answers to the questions is
“Yes,” then you would need to recalculate the DFP for those portions affected.

I hope this is of some help. é /OZ 0 93

Steven Courtemanche NMSS/RGN1 MATERIALS-002

RECD IN LAT.$ 204 /]



' HeaItH Physicist
U.S. NRC, RI, DNMS, CIRDA

From: Gibbs, Kevin C. [maiito:kevingibbs@schulzelectric.com]

Sent: Thursday, April 18, 2019 4:45 PM

To: Courtemanche, Steven <Steven.Courtemanche@nrc.gov>

Subject: [External_Sender] DCE for Timken Motor and Crane Services, LLC.

Mr. Courtemanche,
| did receive your voice message. | apologize for not getting back to you sooner.

In 2018 I asked Radiation Safety Associates, Inc. (RSA) to perform an evaluation of our Decommissioning Cost
Estimate. RSA provided me with a Letter of Methodology explaining that the current amount of money found in
Timken’s Decommission Trust Fund would be enough to fully fund the decommission of our facility at this
time. Do you consider this Letter of Methodology acceptable for your records, or will I need to provide a
detailed Decommission Cost Estimate? I attached a copy of the Letter of Methodology for your review.

Thank you,

Kevin Gibbs | Radiation Safety Officer | +1 203 859 7418 desk | +1 203 859 4092 cell
Timken Motor & Crane Srvcs LLC | Mail Code: NHA-1 | 30 Gando Drive | New Haven, Connecticut 06513 | Stronger. By Design.

TIMKEN

This message and any attachments are intended for the individual or entity named above. If you are not the
intended recipient, please do not forward, copy, print, use or disclose this communication to others; also please
notify the sender by replying to this message, and then delete it from your system. The Timken Company / The
Timken Corporation

This message and any attachments are intended for the individual or entity named above. If you are not the
intended recipient, please do not forward, copy, print, use or disclose this communication to others; also please
notify the sender by replying to this message, and then delete it from your system. The Timken Company / The
Timken Corporation
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Name and Address of Applicant and/or Licensee Date
05/08/2019
License Number(s)
Timken Motor and Crane Services, LLC 06-31045-01
Attn: Kevin Gibbs Mail Control Number(s)
Radiation Safety Officer 612093  Financial Assurance
30 Gando Drive
New Haven, CT 06513 Licensing and/or Technical Reviewer or Branch

Commercial, Industrial, R&D, and Academic Branch

This is to acknowledge receipt of your: E-Mail [ ] Application  Dated:  04/26/2019

The initial processing, which included an administrative review, has been performed.
[ ] Amendment [ ] Termination [ ] New License [ ] Renewal

There were no administrative omissions identified during our initial review.

D This is to acknowledge receipt of your application for renewal of the material(s) license identified
above. Your application is deemed timely filed, and accordingly, the license will not expire until final
action has been taken by this office.

D Your application for a new NRC license did not include your taxpayer identification number. Please
complete and submit NRC Form 531, Request for Taxpayer ldentification Number, located at the
following link:  http://www.nrc.gov/reading-rm/doc-collections/forms/nrc531.pdf

Follow the instructions on the form for submission.

D The following administrative omissions have been identified:

Your application has been assigned the above listed MAIL CONTROL NUMBER. When calling to inquire about this
action, please refer to this control number. Your application has been forwarded to a technical reviewer. Please
note that the technical review, which is normally completed within 180 days for a renewal application (90 days for all
other requests), may identify additional omissions or require additional information. If you have any questions
concerning the processing of your application, our contact information is listed below:

Region |

U. S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission

Division of Nuclear Materials Safety

2100 Renaissance Boulevard, Suite 100

King of Prussia, PA 19406-2713

(610) 337-5260, (610) 337-56313,

(610) 337-5398, (610) 337-5513 or (610) 337-5239

NRC FORM 532 (05-2016)





