
From: Rakowski, Joseph
To: Freeman, Stanley
Subject: [External_Sender] RE: Export License Application
Date: Monday, July 02, 2018 12:57:30 PM

Dear Mr. Freeman,
 
Our finance department mistakenly paid by credit card through pay.gov. Please return the

application and I’ll resubmit after August 24th. We’ll cancel the charge. Thank you.
 
Best regards,
 
Joe Rakowski
 

From: Freeman, Stanley [mailto:Stanley.Freeman@nrc.gov] 
Sent: Monday, July 02, 2018 11:02 AM
To: Rakowski, Joseph
Subject: Export License Application
 
Good morning Mr. Rakowski,
 
An application for export license has arrived in our offices, but the application came without
a form of payment.  Until August 24, 2018, applications for export and import will still incur
fees.  If you’d like for the application to be reviewed at this time, payment in the amount of
$3,900.00, which will cover the cost of the application review as well as the required
request for consent.  If you’d prefer to wait until after August 24th, when fees will no longer
be assessed, then please let me know and I will return the application without action.  If you
have any questions, do not hesitate to ask.
 
 
 
 
Kind regards,
Stanley Z. Freeman II
Licensing Assistant
Export Controls and Nonproliferation Branch
Office of International Programs
301-287-9064
 
 
McLaren confidentiality statement: "The information contained in this communication,
including attachments, is confidential, may be privileged, and is intended only for the use of
the named recipient(s). Unauthorized use, disclosure, forwarding or copying is strictly
prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this communication in error, please
notify me IMMEDIATELY at the phone number or pager listed above."
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