Hickman, John

From: Tom Rielly <tr649@sbcglobal.net>
Sent: Thursday, November 02, 2017 6:51 PM
To: Hickman, John _ \
Subject: [External_Sender] Re: Re: Fw: LTP Zion

A
Yes and yes, needed confirm Licensee for some reason did not want to cite the L/C amount during the most recent
meeting. _
Thanks

From: "Hickman, John" <John.Hickman@nrc.gov>
To: Tom Rielly <tr649@sbcglobal.net>

Sent: Thursday, November 2, 2017 2:24 PM
Subject: RE: Re: Fw: LTP Zion

Tom

As | previously told you the amount of the Letter of Credit is reduced as the project work is completed. As of
the end of September 2017, the Letter of Credit was at $99million.

John

From: Tom Rielly [mailto:tr649@sbcglobal.net]
Sent: Tuesday, October 31, 2017 5:16 PM

To: Hickman, John <John.Hickman@nrc.gov>
Subject: [External_Sender] Re: Fw: LTP Zion

Thank you. What is the current STANDING letter of credit amount? This came up at a recent meeting and the suggestion
was it had been reduced but was adequate?

Adequate was not defined especially now that the licensee forecasts it will be leaving the site ( 8/18) MOST LIKELY as all
work will have been completed and the NRC will then conduct their reviews.

j

From: "Hickman, John" <John.Hickman@nrc.gov>
To: Tom Rielly <tr649@sbcglobal.net>

Sent: Tuesday, October 31, 2017 3:31 PM
Subject: RE: Fw: LTP Zion

Tom,

The most recent decommissioning funding status report for Zion is attached. | will check on reporting for the
decommissioning of the ISFSI.

John

From: Tom Rielly [mailto:tr649@sbcglobal.net]
Sent: Tuesday, October 31, 2017 4:05 PM
To: Hickman, John <John.Hickman@nrc.gov>




Cc: Hickman, John <John.Hickman@nrc.gov>
Subject: [External_Sender] Fw: LTP Zion

Please confirm to Vista 360 the current balances in all trust accounts
Thank you

----- Forwarded Message -——

From: Tom Rielly <tr649@sbcglobal.net>

To: John Hickman <john.hickman@nrc.gov>
Cc: John Hickman <jbh@nrc.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 25, 2017 12:00 PM
Subject: Fw: LTP Zion

Reports and Zion Solutions indicate approximately $ 45 MM remaining in Zion Decmm Trust Funds
What is the amount of the previous waiver ( set aside given for future fuel management) NRC granted.
Our understanding is that these proceeds are still in the Trust Funds but are not reported by the licensee.

Please advise and confirm. Below LTP also
- Thank you

Tom Rielly
Vista 360

----— Forwarded Message --—-

From: Tom Rielly <tr649@sbcglobal.net>
To: John Hickman <jph@nrc.gov>

Cc: "jbh@nrc.gov" <jph@nrc.gov>

Sent: Monday, October 23, 2017 10:12 AM
Subject: LTP Zion

Could you advise the current status or short list remaining for NRC acceptance of the Zion Solutions License Termination
Plan? ' '
Thank you





