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Junod, Rebecca

From: Victoria Hollinger <Victoria.Hollinger@fmc.com>

Sent: Monday, October 23, 2017 5:07 PM

To: Ullrich, Elizabeth

Subject: [External_Sender] RE: RE: RE: additional documentation needed RE: RE: RE: [Ext] RE: FMC
- License No. 37-35439-01

Attachments: Standby Trust Agreement.pdf 0303?0 (.a 3

Thank you, Betsy. 1 just learned today that the original Stanby Trust was inadvertently sent to our outside counsel
instead of the NRC, You should have that in hand tomorrow. | have aiso attached a scan of the Standby Trust that
includes completed Schedules B and C.

| believe that is the remaining outstanding items.

Please let me know if you need anything else. Do you have an anticipated date for issuance of the license? |ask
because the NRC license is a prerequisite to our filing for the Delaware radioactive materials licenses.

Thank you again,
Tory

Victoria W. Hollinger
Environmental, Health & Safety Counsel

FMC

FMC Corporation

2929 Walnut Street, Philadelphia, PA 19104
Office: 215-299-5810

Cell: 215-287-5861
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From: Ullrich, Elizabeth [mailto:Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov]

Sent: Friday, October 20, 2017 10:23 AM

To: Victoria Hollinger <Victoria.Hollinger@fmc.com>

Subject: RE: RE: RE: additional documentation needed RE: RE: RE: [Ext] RE: FMC - License No. 37-35439-01

Within the region, we believe it is okay. | do have a question out to our program office, but the person who is
best to answer the question will not be in until next week.

| will be proceeding assuming we are okay as is.

Betsy

From: Victoria Hollinger [mailto:Victoria.Hollinger@fmec.com]

Sent: Thursday, October 19, 2017 7:16 PM

To: Ullrich, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov>

Subject: [External_Sender] RE: RE: additional documentation needed RE: RE: RE: [Ext] RE: FMC - License No. 37-35439-01
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Hi Betsy. Attached please find the Certificate of Financial Assurance. Have you heard back on whether Letter of
Acknowledgment is necessary given that the Standby Trust Agreement was notarized? Please let me know. Thank you!

Victoria W. Hollinger
Environmental, Health & Safety Counsel

+ Vi<

FMC Corporation

2929 Walnut Street, Philadeiphia, PA 19104
Office: 215-299-5810

Cell: 215-287-5861

From: Ullrich, Elizabeth [mailto:Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov]

Sent: Wednesday, October 18, 2017 3:01 PM

To: Victoria Hollinger <Victoria.Hollinger@fmc.com>

Subject: RE: RE: additional documentation needed RE: RE: RE: [Ext] RE: FMC - License No. 37-35439-01

Not a problem ©

From: Victoria Hollinger [mailto:Victoria.Hollinger@fmc.com]

Sent: Wednesday, October 18, 2017 2:39 PM

To: Ullrich, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov>

Subject: [External_Sender] RE: additional documentation needed RE: RE: RE: {Ext] RE: FMC - License No. 37-35439-01

Thank you, Betsy. | am working to get these pieces completed as quickly as possible, but will likely not have to you to
today. Please let me know if that presents a problem.

Victoria W. Hollinger
Environmental, Health & Safety Counsel

FMC

FMC Corporation

2929 Walnut Street, Philadelphia, PA 19104
Office: 215-299-5810

Cell: 215-287-5861
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From: Ullrich, Elizabeth [mailto:Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov]

Sent: Wednesday, October 18, 2017 1:23 PM

To: Victoria Hollinger <Victoria.Hollinger@fmc.com>

Subject: additional documentation needed RE: RE: RE: [Ext] RE: FMC - License No. 37-35439-01

Victoria,

| reviewed the financial instruments that were sent, and there are documents missing in addition to the
Certification of Financial Assurance (NUREG 1757, Vol 3, App A.2.4) that] mentioned in an earlier email. The
additional documents are:



- Schedule B of the Standby Trust Agreement (STA). Although Schedule B is shown on the same page
as Schedule A, it is not completed.

- Schedule C of the STA; this also is on the same page as Schedule A but is not completed.

- Letter of Acknowledgement: this is shown on the same page as the “Specimen Certificate of
Resolution”. This should be a separate document, completed, and is needed to support the STA. | am
trying to find out if the notarization on the STA would be acceptable in lieu of the Letter of
Acknowledgement but have not yet gotten an answer to that question. [The Specimen Certificates of
Resolution, and of Events, correctly are not required to be filled in at this time.]

Thanks,
Betsy

From: Victoria Hollinger [mailto:Victoria.Hollinger@fmc.com]

Sent: Wednesday, October 18, 2017 11:03 AM

To: Ullrich, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov>

Cc: Christina Kaba <Christina.Kaba@fmc.com>

Subject: [External_Sender] RE: RE: [Ext] RE: FMC - License No. 37-35439-01

Thank you, Betsy. We will complete and return to you. Will you please confirm the mailing address to which this
document {and the Standby Trust Agreement) should be sent?

Victoria W. Hollinger
Environmental, Health & Safety Counsel

+MC

FMC Corporation

2929 Walnut Street, Philadelphia, PA 19104
Office: 215-299-5810

Cell; 215-287-5861

From: Ulirich, Elizabeth [mailto:Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, October 18, 2017 10:58 AM

To: Victoria Hollinger <Victoria.Hollinger@fmc.com>

Cc: Christina Kaba <Christina.Kaba@fmc.com>

Subject: RE: RE: [Ext] RE: FMC - License No. 37-35439-01

And one more form, please: the “Certification of Financial Assurance” form, filled out for your license
application. It can be found in NUREG 1757, volume 3, Appendix a.2.4.
https://www.nrc.gov/docs/ML 1204/ML 12048A683.pdf

| have attached a version in Word that | developed by copy-and-paste from the 1556 Vol 3 App A.2.4, or you
can use the link above. If | missed this in the documents you aiready sent, just let me know that, please.
Thanks,

Betsy

From: Victoria Hollinger [mailto:Victoria.Hollinger@fmc.com]

Sent: Wednesday, October 18, 2017 10:07 AM

To: Ullrich, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Ullrich@nrc.gov>

Cc: Christina Kaba <Christina.Kaba@fmc.com>

Subject: [External_Sender] RE: [Ext] RE: FMC - License No. 37-35439-01




Thank you, Bétsy. IV\(II'“ put the original iﬁ the mail today.

Victoria W. Hollinger
Environmental, Health & Safety Counsel

FMC

FMC Corporation

2929 Walnut Street, Philadelphia, PA 19104
Office: 215-299-5810

Cell: 215-287-5861
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From: Ullrich, Elizabeth [mailto:Elizabeth.Ulirich@nrc.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, October 18, 2017 7:48 AM

To: Victoria Hollinger <Victoria.Hollinger@fmc.com>

Cc: Christina Kaba <Christina.Kaba@fmc.com>

Subject: [Ext] RE: FMC - License No. 37-35439-01

According to our guidance in NUREG 1757, Volume 3, Appendix 12. | need an “originally signed duplicate” of
the Standby Trust Agreement. | can base my review on the scanned copy, but apparently 1 still need an
originally signed duplicate for our files in safe storage.

Thanks,
Betsy

From: Victoria Hollinger [mailto:Victoria.Hollinger@fmc.com]
Sent: Tuesday, October 17, 2017 4:25 PM

To: Ullrich, Elizabeth <Elizabeth. Ullrich@nrc.gov>

Cc: Christina Kaba <Christina.Kaba@fmc.com>

Subject: [External_Sender] FMC - License No. 37-35439-01

Hi Betsy. As a follow up to FMC’s October 6, 2017 response to the NRC’s Requests for Additional Information, | have
attached executed copies of the Letter of Credit and Standby Trust Agreement. | understand that the original signed
Letter of Credit is being mailed directly to the NRC; please let me know if you would like a hard copy of the Standby Trust
Agreement as well.

Please contact me should you have any additional guestions.
Thank you,

Victoria W. Hollinger
Environmental, Health & Safety Counsel

+MC

FMC Corporation

2929 Walnut Street, Philadelphia, PA 19104
Office: 215-299-5810

Cell: 215-287-5861



