
From: Helvenston, Edward
To: "Silberg, Jay E."
Cc: Anthony Nellis; Jonathan Schulz (jonathan.schulz@autoliv.com); David M. Slaughter PhD ( @gmail.com)
Subject: RE: Aerotest/Nuclear Labyrinth - Non-Proprietary Treatment of Certain Financial Information; Correction to

License Transfer Proposed Technical Specifications
Date: Wednesday, November 02, 2016 4:34:00 PM

Jay,
 
Thank you for the clarification e-mail, I will place your e-mail in publicly-available NRC
ADAMS for documentation.
 
Ed
 
 
Ed Helvenston, U.S. NRC
Research and Test Reactor Licensing Branch (PRLB)
Division of Policy and Rulemaking (DPR)
Office of Nuclear Reactor Regulation (NRR)
O-11C14
(301) 415-4067
 
 
 
From: Silberg, Jay E. [mailto:jay.silberg@pillsburylaw.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, November 02, 2016 4:23 PM
To: Helvenston, Edward <Edward.Helvenston@nrc.gov>
Cc: Anthony Nellis <anthony.nellis@autoliv.com>; Jonathan Schulz (jonathan.schulz@autoliv.com)
<jonathan.schulz@autoliv.com>; David M. Slaughter PhD ( @gmail.com)
< @gmail.com>
Subject: [External_Sender] Aerotest/Nuclear Labyrinth - Non-Proprietary Treatment of Certain
Financial Information; Correction to License Transfer Proposed Technical Specifications
 
 
Ed – During our October 31 phone call, you asked that Aerotest Operations, Inc.
(“Aerotest”) and Nuclear Labyrinth LLC (“Nuclear Labyrinth”) clarify that certain
financial information provided to the NRC in connection with the license transfer
application did not require to be treated as proprietary.  You also requested that
Aerotest and Nuclear Labyrinth recognize a typographical error in the proposed
Technical Specifications for the license transfer.  This is to confirm on behalf of
Aerotest and Nuclear Labyrinth the following:

1.      The following financial information that was provided to the NRC in
connection with the license transfer application as proprietary and
confidential no longer needs to receive proprietary and confidential
treatment.  This financial information is as follows: $943,225 that would be
transferred to Aerotest to fund O&M for the first 12 months after the license
transfer; $742,410 (plus interest) as the amount to be paid to the
Department of Energy for the disposal of fuel from the Aerotest
Radiography and Research Reactor; $625,000 as the cost to purchase



storage/shipping casks for damaged fuel; and $300,000 as the value of the
Nuclear Labyrinth letter of credit that it would maintain after license transfer.

2.      Section 12.1.1 of the proposed Technical Specifications transmitted by my
letter of October 10, 2016 included a typographical error in that the word
“operation” on line 2 should read “operations”.

Please let me know if you need any further information or have any additional
questions.
 
Jay E. Silberg | Pillsbury Winthrop Shaw Pittman LLP
————————————————————————————————
Tel:  202.663.8063 | Fax:  202.663.8007 | Cell:  301.523.5378
1200 Seventeenth Street, NW | Washington, DC 20036-3006

Email:  Jay.Silberg@pillsburylaw.com
www.pillsburylaw.com
 

The contents of this message, together with any attachments, are intended only for the use of
the individual or entity to which they are addressed and may contain information that is legally
privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you
are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of this message, or any
attachment, is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify the
original sender or the Pillsbury Winthrop Shaw Pittman Help Desk at Tel: 800-477-0770,
Option 1, immediately by telephone or by return E-mail and delete this message, along with
any attachments, from your computer. Thank you.
 
 
    




