- RO o
-

“NRE FoRm 396 U.S. NUCLEAR REGULATORY COMMISSION | DOCKE LIHTEETN ) / |
(276} . A0 a4, 325/325
‘ . = %
‘ : . . \ - FILE NUMBER
NRC DISTRIBUTION ror PART 50 DOCKET MATERIAL
?—5- 2 FROM: DATE OF DOCUMENT
Carolina Power & Light Comp?ny. : 41277177
Mr. Jerome Saltzman Raleigh, North Carolina DATE RECEIVED
' William E. Graham, Jr. 5/2/77 ’ -
Bocrren OnoTorizeD PROP INPUT FORM NUMBER OF COPIES RECEIVED
- #bricinaL WUNCLASSIFIED ' ' ﬂ
| Qeory : / S / é/t)E
DESCRIFTION ENCLOSURE

ATTACHED FOR YCUR ACTION/INFORMATION IS
ENDORSEMENT/ INDEMNITY AGREEMENT..vaises

-
-

(1-P)+(6-P)
PLANT MAME: HeBe Robinson #2/Brunswick #2
RJL _ :
| ' FOR ACTION/INFORMATION —
],‘,:;a SRR )
HEC PUR
DINITZ w/2 cys for ACHLOM
H, JORDAN

TIiC

N51C

INTERNAL DISTRIBUTION

EXTERNAL DISTRIBUTION

CONTROL NUMBER
PRy /3

NECFORM 196 (2-76)




;t .» . .} | -«%Q“f" _» “l' : » | "... . «‘l'
I CP&L

S Carolina Power & Light Company

' [ ) . P. O. Box 1551 e Raleigh, N. C. 27602

feguiatol)

WILLIAM E. GRAHAM, JR. : ' ,
Senior Vice President ) April ~27 , 1977 -

and General Counsel

Mr. Jerome Saltzman, Chief
Antitrust & Indemnity Group
Nuclear Reactor Regulatiomn
Nuclear Regulatory Commission
Washington, D. C. 20555

Re: Docket Nos. 50-324
50-325

50-261
Dear Mr. Saltzman: ,
I enclose herewith Amendment to Indemnity Agreement
No. B-43 and Amendment to Indemnity Agreement No. B~71 of"
Carolina Power. & Light Company.
. Yours very triizézj/
William E. Graham, Jr
:”% WEG :mc

Enclosures

99/942/3Q




: ' )
UNITED STATES :
NUCLEAR REGULATORY COMMISSION
WASHINGTON, D. C. 20555

Docket Nos. 50-324
50-325

AMENDMENT TO INDEMNITY AGREEMENT NO. B-71
| AMENDMENT NO. 6

Effective WAy 11977 R Indemm'ty Agreement No. B-71, between
Carolina Power & Light Company, and the Atomic Energy Commission, dated
January 14, 1974, as amended, is hereby further amended as follows:

The amount "$125,000,000" is deleted wherever it
appears and the amount "$140,000,000" is substituted therefor.

The amount "$96,875,000" is deleted wherever it appears and
the amount "$108,500,000" is substituted therefor. ‘

The amount "$28,125,000" is deleted wherever it appears and
. the amount "$31,500,000" is substituted therefor.

Item 2a of the Attachment to the indemnity agreement is deleted in its
entirety and the following supstituted therefor:

- Item 2 - Amount of financial protection

a. $1,000, 000 (From 12:01 a.m., January 14, 1974, to
12 midnight, December 26, 1974,
inclusive)

$110,000,000 (From 12:01 a.m., December 27, 1974, to
12 midnight, March 20, 1975,

A inclusive)
$125,000,000 (From 12:01 a.m., March 21, 1975, to
' 12 midnight, APR 3¢ 1977 ,
inclusive)




$140,000,000 (From 12:01 a.m., MAY 1 1977 )

F?R THE UNITED STATES NUCLEAR REGULATORY COMMISSION

Jerome Saltzman, Chijéf
Antitrust & Indemnity Group
Nuclear Reactor Régulation

Accepted A’IM_‘JS’, 1977

CAROLINA POWER & LIGHT COMPANY! -

oot




S - .
L

. UNITED STATES :
NUCLEAR REGULATORY COMMISSION
WASHINGTON, D. C. 20555

Docket No. 50-261

AMENDMENT TO INDEMNITY AGREEMENT NO. B-43

AMENDMENT NO. 6

Effective  MAY 1 1977 ~» Indemnity Agreement No. B-43, between
Carolina Power & Light Company, and the Atomic Energy Commission, dated
December 4, 1969, as amended, is hereby further amended as follows:

The amount."$125,000,000" is deTeted wherever it _
. appears and the amount "$140,000,000" is substituted therefor.

The amount "$96,875,000" is deleted wherever it appears and
the amount "$108,500,000" is substituted therefor.

The amount "$28,125,000" is deleted wherever it appears and
the amount "$31,500,000" is substituted therefor.

Item 2a of the Attachment to the indemnity agreement is deleted in its
entirety and the following substituted therefor:

Item 2 - Amount of financial protection

a. $1,000,000 (From 12:01 a.m., December 4, 1969, to
12 midnight, July 30, 1970,
: : inclusive) :
$82,000,00 (From 12:01 a.m., July 31, 1970, to
12 midnight, February 29, 1972,
inclusive)
$95,000, 000 (From 12:01 a.m., March 1, 1972, to
12 midnight, February 28, 1974,
‘ _ inclusive)
$110,000,000 (From 12:01 a.m., March 1, 1974, to
' 12 midnight, March 20, 1975,
inclusive)




9o . . .

$125,000,000 (From 12:01 a.m., March 21, 19753 to

12 midnight, AFR § ¢ 1977 >
o ' inclusive) :
$140,000,000 (From 12:01 a.m., MAY L W77 - - )

s

FOR THE UNITED STATES NUCLEAB REGULATORY COMMISSION

o Asrlts

Nuclear Reactor Regulation

, e
Accepted /4’/4/,,,[ 33 ;977

o i S S phiond

CAROLINA POWER & LIGHT COMPANYa/ffzkggl




f

U.S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission,

washington, D.C. 20535, of: * * *

* * » . . .

PrRT 50—-LICENSING OF FRCDUCTION
AND UTILIZATION FACILITIES

§ 50.59 - [Amended]

. 4. Paragraph (a)(2).()) of §50.59'0f
10 CFR Part 50 is amended by deleting

the words ‘“accident of malfunction of

equipment” and substituting therefor
“accident or malfunction of equipment”.

5. In paragraph 2. of Appendix F of 10
CFR Part 50, the sentence reading
“NRC will take title to the radioactive
waste material upon transfer to a Fed-
eral Repository’”. is amended by deleting
“NRC” and substituting therefor ‘“The
Energy Research and Development Ad-
ministration”. '

6. Footnote 2 of Appendix I, 10 CFR
Part 50, is amended by deleting “§ 50.36a
(2)" and substituting therefor “§ 50.36a
(a) (2)".

(Sec. 161b., Pub. L. 83-703, 68 Stat. 948; sec.
201, Pub. 1. 93-438, 88 Stat. 1242 (42 US.C.
2201(b), 5841).) .

Dated at Bethesda, Maryland, this
28th day of March 1977. :

For the Nuclear Regulatory Commis~
sion. .

LEE V. GOSSICK,

Ezecutive Director for
: Operations.

" |FR Doc.77-11304 Filed 4-16-77:8:45 am]

PART 140—FINANCIAL PROTECTION RE-
QUIREMENTS AND INDEMNITY AGREE-
MENTS :

Miscellaneous Amendments
AGENCY: Nuclear Regulatory Commis-

" sion. .

ACTION: Final Rule.

SUMMARY: The Nuclear Regulatory
Commission is amending its regulations
“Financial Protection Requirements and
Indemnity Agreements,” to increase the
level of the primary layer of financial
protection required of certain indemni-
fied licensees, and make certain other
niinor changes in indemnity agreement
forms and in the facility form of nuclear
liability insurance policy furnished -as
financial protection. The Commission is
amending its reguiations at the present
time to coincide, as statutorily required,
with the increase in the level of the pri-
mary layer of insurance provided by pri-
vate nuclear liability insurance pools.
EFFECTIVE DATE: May 1, 19717.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CON-
TACT:
Mr. Ira Dinitz. Antitrust and Indem-
nity Group, U.S. Nuclear Regulatory
Commission, Washington., D.C. 20555,
301-443-6961.
SUPPLEMENTARY  INFORMATION:
The provisions of section 170 of the

FEDERAL

- bility-Property Insurance

RULES AND: REGULATIONS

Atomic Energy Act. as amended, (the
Act) require production and utilization
facility licensces to have and maintain
financial protection to cever public lia-
bility claims resulting {rom a nuclear in-
cident. The Commission has exercised its
discretionary authority to require per-
sons licensed to possess plutonium in the
amournt of 5 kilograms or more and per-
sons licensed to process plutonitum in the

amount of 1 kilogram or more for use in.

plutonium processing and -fuel fabrica-
tion plants to also maintain financial
protection at the maximum amount
available from private sources. Section
170 of the Act, in conjunction with sec-
tion 201 of the Energy Reorganization
Act of 1974, as amended, requires the
Nuelear Regulatory Conunission to in-
demnify the licensee and other persons
indemnified, up to the statutory limita=-
tion on liability, against public liahility
claims in excess of the amount of finan-
cial protection required. Subsection 170b.
of the Act requires that for facilities de-
signed for producing substantial amounts
of electricity and having a rated capac-
ity of 100 electrical megawatts or more,
the amount of financial protection® re-
quired shall be the maximum amount
‘available from private sources. For other
licensees, the Commission may require
lesser amounts of financial protection.
Primary financial protection may be in
the form of private insurance, private
contractual indemnities, self-insurance
or other proof of financial responsibility,
or a combination of such measures. Non-
profit educational institutions and Fed-
eral agencies are exempted by statute
from the financial protection require-
ments. .

The insurers who provide the nuclear
liability insurance, Nuclear Energy Lia-
Association
(NEL~-PIA) and Mutual Atomic Energy
Liability Underwriters (MAELU), have
advised the Commission that effective
January- 1, 1977, the maximum amount
of private nuclear energy liability in-
surance available was increased from
$125 million to $140 million. Pursuant to
‘the provisions of subsection 170b. of the
Act, the amount of primary firancial
protection. required for facilities having
a rated capacity of 100 electrical mega-
watts oy more will be increased to $140.

million, effective May 1, 1977. In accord- -

ance with recent amendments to 10 CFR
Part 140 (42 FR 46, January 3. 1877),
licensees of plutonium processing and
fuel fabrication plants reguired to main-

' Public Law 94-197 does not by its pre-
cise languaye requiré maintenunce of n “pri-
mary’ {i.e.. nuclear liahiliry insurance) layer
and a “secondary” (le. retros tive pre-
mium) laver of financial prote n but
merely considers the combination of these
two. layers as ciinancial proteciion.” Hows-
ever, the recently published amendments (32
FR 46, Jan. 4, 1977y to 10 CFR Part i40 im-
plementing part of Public Law 94-197. dis-
tinguish  bewween  primary and secondary
layer of financial protection on the
their ditferent insurance charactes
amendments in this rute e solely to in-
creases i the primary Liyver of finanzial
protectiong, . :

' ' 20139

tain the maximum amount of financial
protection will have to comply with this

‘requirement on August 1, 1977. The fol-

lowing amendments to 10 CFR Par{ 140.
“Financial Protection Requirements and
Indemnity Agreeinents.”  rotiect  this
requirement.

Other changes to Part 140 to imple-
ment Pub. L. 94-197 relate to the exten-
sion of indemnity protection to 1)
indemnified shipments of new or spent
fuel while outside of the United Siutes
and any other nation. during transit
from one NRC licensce to anotheyr and
(2) stationary nuclear facilities, such as
floating nuclear power plants, licensed
by the NRC and located in internati
waters. There is one slight difference
tween the endorsement to ihe fachiiy
form of nuclear liability insurance poi-
icy submitted by NEL-PIA and the
amendments to the Comniission inde:
nity agreement form implementing this

change. The endorsement, uniike the in--

demnity amendments, will not extend

coverage at this time to nuclear material

being transported to or from a fioating
nuclear power plant. This coverags would
be extended, however. hefove such &
plant would be licensed.

Pub. L. 94-197 also provided that i
the event of an “exiraordinary nuclear
occurrence” the Commission could en-
force provisions in an insurance policy
furnished as proof of financial protec-
tion and incorporated in indemnity
agreements, requiring a licensee to
waive any defense based upon a statute
of limitations if suit is instituted
3 years from the date on which the
claimant first knew or reasonably could
have known of his injury or damsage, but
in no event more than 20 yeavs afger
the date of the nuclear incident. Befcre
the enactment of Pub. L. §4-197.. the ex-
tension of the time for initiating of &
suit for damages was only 10 years alter

in

the date of the nuclear incident. Boih -

the endorsement to the facility form and
the indemnity agreement forms imple-
ment this change as set forth below.

Apart from the change discussed
above, there is one additional ncnsub-
stantive mcdification in the present
waiver of defenses endorsement submit-
ted by NEL-PIA that differs from the
vaiver of defgonses endorsement now
contained in § 140.91. The existing en-
dorsement was amendsd by addition of
a new paragraph 6 published in the F
EfAL RECISTER on Neovernber 11,.1971
FR 2153803). That new paragraph }
cally provided that a licensce’s wq
employed at an indemnified site execlu-
sively in connection with the ce It
tion of a nuclear reactor for whicly no
operating license had heen issued would
bhe permitted to take advan ¢ ool the
waiver of defenses provisions of the fa-
cility form. The nuclear Habilily insur-
ance poeols intended that this pars it
be published as a scparate end
and not as a pary of tne gene
endorsement. Hence, Uids g P is
now being retained as a sepioale en-
dorsement. '

This rule does not ¢ontain auy provi-
sions implementing  (or interpreting

REGISTER, VOL. 42, NO. 74——MONDAY, APRIL 1B, 1977

\)




T20110

the amendments to H.R. 8631 introduced
by Senator Tiathaway, agreed {0 by ihe
Sensate and contained in Pub. L. 94-1987
regarding exclusion of the cozts of In-
vestigating .and settling claims {rom
funids used for the payment of claims.

Since the amendments set out below
conform the Comimission's regulations
tova statutory requirement, the Com-
mission has found that good cause exists
for omitting public notice of proposed
rule  making and public procedure
theron as unnecessary.

Pursuant to the Atomic-Energy Act of
1934, as amended, the Enersy Reorzani-
zation. Act of 1974, 85 amended, and sec-
tions 552 and 553 of Title 5 of the United
‘States Code. the following amendments
to Title 10, Chapter I, Part 140, Code of
Federal Regulations, are published as &
document subject to codification.-

§ 110.11 [Amended]

1. The present
amended by deleting “$
substituting therefor «$140,000,000.”
Section 140.11(2) (4) which pecomes ef-
fective on August'l, 1877 is also amended
by deleting «g125,000,000" and substitut-
ing “$140,000,000” therefor.

§ 140.13a [Amended]

is

§ 140.11(2) (%)

2. Section 140.13a(a) is amended by‘

deleting the term “$125 million” and sub-
stituting **$140,000,000" therefor.

"§140.91 - [Amended] '

-3, In §140.91, Appendix A, Condition 4
is amended by revisicg the footnote to
read as follows: .

For policies issued by Nuclear Energy Li-
ability-Property Insurance . Association the
amount will be «$108.500,000"; for policies
issued by AMutual Atomic "Energy Liability
Underwriters, the amount will be “83l.-
500,000.”

4. In § 14091, Appendix A, paragraph

- J1L-of the “QOptional Amendatory En-

dorsement” is amended by revising the
footnote to read as follows: .

For policies issued by Nuclear ‘Energy Li-
ability-Property Insurance Association the
amount will be +$108,500.000;" for .poticies
issued by Mutual Atomic Energy Liability
Underwriters amount. will be “$31,-
500,000.” : ' :

5. In § 140.91. Appendix A, the “Waiver
of Defenses Endorsement” is amended by
deleting paragraph 6.

6. Section 14091, Appendix A, is
amended by adding the following en-
dorzements: : . :

NUCLEAR ENERGY LIABTLITY POLICY
. (FACILITY FORM)

or DEFENSE ENDORSEMENT

o
tne

Walvar

ENCE)

{ EXTRAORDINARY Nucrear QCCUR
nimsel!
policy.,

“The named insured, ‘acting for
and every other insured under the
and  the members
agrne as follows:

1. With respect to any exiraordinary ni-
clear ocgurrence to which the polley apntles
prool -of Anancial protection and whirh
{a) Arises out of or results from or oC-

curs: in tlie course the construction, posses-

sion, or operation of the Tacility, ot

as

25.000.000™" and .

- clear

‘RULESAND. REGULATIONS

(b) Arises out ‘of or results from or occurs
in the course of the transpcriation of nuclear
material to or from the fachiity, ’

{he insureds and the companies agree to
walve. . . , L

(1) Any lssue or defenjse as to the conduct
of the claimant or the fault of the insureds,
including but not limited to:

i1y MNegligence, )

(i) goz\txfi})\xtox'y.neg.ﬂ‘-'fcucc,

(i) " Assumption of risk. and

(iv) Unloresceuble intervening  causes,
whether involting the conduct of a third
persci. or an act of God,
(2) 4 ny issue or defense as to charitable

‘or governmental immunity. and

or defense bassd en any stat-

#1i ns if suit is.inst uted within
tnree (3) vears {rom the date*on ‘which the
claimantg firsg knew, or rgasol}abl3’ ‘could have
ow,-of his bodily injury or property dam-
and the cause thereof, but’in- no event
more than twenty (20)'years after the date
of the nuctear incident. * ’

The waiver of any such issue or‘defense shall
be eTective regardless of whether such issue
or defense may ‘otherwise be deemed juris-
dictional “or relaiing to am element.-in the
cause'of action®; "

2, The waivers-set
ahove donot appiy to .

(a) “Bodily injury or

torth in paragraph 1.

'property damage

which is intentionally sustaired:by the claim-

ant or which results from a nuclear incident
inten_tions’xily and wrongfully caused by the
ciaimant; ‘

(b} Bodily injury sustained by any claim-
ant who is employed at the site of and in
connection” with the activity where the ex-
tracordinary nuclear cccurrence takes place
if benefits therefor are either payable or
v:equirqd‘tq,be-provided under any workmen’s
compensation 'or occupational disease law:

(c) .Any claim for purnitive or exemplary
damages, provided, with respect to any claim
for swrongful death under any State law
which provides for damages only punitive
in nature, this. exclusion does not apply to
the extent.that the claimant hrs sustained
actual da}maggs‘, measured by the pecuniary
injuries resulting from such death but not to
exceed the (}na.ximum“a:nqunt otherwise re-
coverable under such 1aw. LT

3. The walvers set . forth in paragraph 1.
above ‘shall’ be effective only with respect to
podily injury or propefty damage to which
the policy applies under its.terms other than
this endorsement; provided,  however. that
with ' respect ‘to bodily . injury or property
damage.resuiting from an-extraordinary nv-
& occurrence, Insuring Agreement IV,
b 3)plicatx_oh~_of ‘Policy s’ shall ot operate to
bar coverzge for- bodily injury or property
damage (a) which ‘iz caused -during the
policy 4period by the nuclear energy hazard
and (») which'is discovered and for which
written - claim is made against he insured
not latér than twenty (20) years after the
date of the éxt‘raord‘xz‘lar;\"nucleat occurrence.

such waivers shall not-apply to, or preju-
dice the prosecution or defense of any claim
or portion of claim which is not within the
protection atfordad under .

{¢) The provisioms of the policy appii-
crbie 10 the Anancial protection required of
the named insured: .

(1) The agresment of indemnificatlon He-
twoen the ired and {he Nuclear
uintory sston made pursuant 1o
tion 170 of the Al mic Energy Act of 10561,
nanded: and ’

seatiott 170e. of the Atomic, Eunergy Act of

1954, as amended. . :
such waivers shall not prectude a defense

based - upon-'the “g3llure . of ‘the claimant to

FEDERAL REGISTER, voL. 42, 'NO. 74—MONDAY, APRIL

ey The Hmit of liability provisions of Sub-

take reasonsble steps to mitigate dama

4. Subject to all of the 1imitations. st
in this endorsement and in .the Atow
Energy Act of 1954, as amended, the wal
set forth in.paragraph 1. above shall be ju
clally enforceable in accordance with t:
- terms against any insured in an act
recover damages because of bodily inju
property damage to which the policy ar
as proof of financial protectio.

5. As used herein:

spxtraordinary nuclear occurrence’” m
an event which the Nuclear Regulatany G
mission has determined to be an extroor
nary nuclear occiurence as def
Atomic Energy Act of 1954, as am nded.

“pinancial protection” and “nuciear
Cent” have the meanings given them in %
Atomic Energy Act of 1954 as amendad

“Claimant” means the person or
tion actually susiaining the hodily inju
rroperty damage and also includes h
signees, legal representatives and other :
sons or organizations-ent(tled to brinzg
action for damages on account of such in
or damage. .

Efective date

ad in

of " this
to form a part of p¢

endorse

Time |

Date of issue.-.---
Endorsement No
For the subscribing companies:

General Manager
Countersigned by ——ccec—wo-oo-mom .

SUPPLEMENTARY ENDORS‘E?\!ENT
WAIVER OF DEFENSES

REACTOR CONSTRUCTION AT THE FACILITY

1t is agreed that in construing the appii-
cation of -paragraph 2.(b) of the Waiver of
Defenses Endorsement (NE-33a) with resz=c
to an extraordinary nuclear occurrence oc-
curring at the facility, a claimant wzo is
employed at the facility in connection th

the construction of a nuclear reactor with
has

respect to which no operating license
peen issued by the Nuclear Regulatory C
mission shall not be considered as empioTed
in connection with the activity where the
extrzordinary nuclear occurrence takes piace

(1) The claimant is employed exclusively
in connéction with the construction of a
nuclear reactor. including all related ecuip-
ment and installations at the facility. and

(2) No operating license has been izsued
by the Nuclear Regulatory -Commission with
respect to the nuciear reactor, and

{3) The ciaimant, is not employed in ¢on-
nection with the possession, storage. u
transfer of nuclear ‘material at the

Efective date of this ~endors
____________________ to form a part o

Time

Date of issue .-

Endorsement NO_ oo —wono- .

For the subscribing companies:
B

Conunt

NUCLEAR

DEFINITION  OF

At
FNER - Hazarp”
FACILITY }

(TripuEM

1t ie werecd that: L Sotely wii act
to an “insured shipment” to WE tha

poticy applies as prool of . finnneial piotecs

18, 1977




20110

the amendments to H.R. 8631 introduced
by Senator Hathaway, agreed to by the
Senate and contained in Pub. L. 94-197
rezarding exclusion of the costs of in-
vestigating and settling claims {rom
funcs used for the payment of claius.

Since the amendments sct oub below
conform the Comumission's regulations
to a statutory requirement, the Com-
mission has found that good cause exists
for omitting public notice of proposed
ruie making and public procedure
thieron as unnecessary.

Pursuant to the Atomic Enerzy Act of
1934, as amended, the Energy Reorgani-
zation Act of 1974, as amended, and sec-
tions 552 and 553 of Title 5 of the United
States Code, the following amendments
to Title 10. Chapter I, Part 140, Code oi
Federal Regulations, are published as 2
docunent subject to codification.

§ 110.11 { Amended]

1. The present 3 140.11(ar (& is
amended by deleting #$125.000.000" and
substituting  therefor %$140,000,000.”
Section 140.11(a) () which becomes ef-
fective on August 1, 1877 1s alsd amended
by deleting #$1925.000,000" and substitut-

-ing +$140,000,000” therefor.

§ 140.13a [Amended]

", 9. Section 140.13a(a) is amended by
deleting the term “$125 million” and sub-
stituting “$140.000.060” therefor.

‘§ 14091 {Amended]

3. In § 140.91, Appendix A, Condition %
is amended by revisicg the footnote to
read as follows: . .

For policies issued by Nuclear Energy Li-
ability-Property Tpnsurance Association the
amount will be +$108,500,000™; for policies
issued by Mutual Atomic Energy Liability
Underwriters, the amount will be “831.-
500,000.”

4. In § 140.91, Appendix A, paragraph

- IIT of the “Optional Amendatory En-

dorsement” is amended by revising the
footnote to read as follows: )

For policies issued by Nuclear Energy Li-
ability-Property Insurance Association the
amount will be +$108,500,000;" for policies
issued by Mutual Atomic Energy Liability
Tncderwriters’ the asmount will. be “33l.-
500,000." -

5. In § 140.91. Appendix A, the “Waiver
of Defenses Endorsement’” is amended by
deleting paragraph 6.

6. Section 14091, Appendix A, Is
amended by adding the foilowing en-
dorsements: : .
NUCLEAR ENERGY LIABILITY POLICT

© {FACILITY FORXM)

WarvsR OF DEFENSE ENDORSEMENT
{ EXTRAORDINARY Nyucrean OCCURRENCE)

The named insured, acting for himself
and every ather ineured undee the policy,
and  the members of oo
agren as follows:

L,\\‘im respect to any exiraordinary nu-
elear occurrence to which the peifes applics
as proof of finaneial protretion and whirh

(a) Arlses out of or results from or ocC-
curs in the course the corstruction, posses-

<ion, or operatlon of the factlity, or

FEDERAL

"or goversy

RULES AND REGULATIONS

(v) Arises out of or results from or occurs
in the course of the transportation of nuclear
material to or from the facllity, .

the insureds and the companies agree to
waive.

(1) Any issue or defense as to the conduct
of the claimant or the fault of the insureds,
including but not timited to:

(i1 Negligence,

(i) Contributory negligence,

(i:1) Assumption of risk. and

(iv) Unforcsceable intervening carises,
whether involving the conduct of a third
perzon, or anact of Gad. .

{2) Any issue or defense as to charitable
mental immunity, and

(3} Any issue or defense basad on any stat-
u-e of limitations i ¢ is instizuzed within
taree (3) vears from the date on which the
claimant first knew, or reasonably could have

- koown. of his bedily injury or property dam-

aze and the cause thereof. but in no event
more than twenty. (20) years after the date
of the nuclear incident.

Tie waiver of any such Issue or defense shall
be eTective regardiess of whe:her such issue
or defense may otherwise be deemed juris-
dictional or relating to an elemént in the
cause of action.

2. The waivers set forth in paragraph 1.

anove do not app!y to

(2) Bedily injury or property damage

which is intentionally sustained by the claim-

ant or which results from 2 nuclear incident
intentionally and wrongfully caused by the
ciaimant;

(h) Bodily injury sustained by any claim-
ant who is employed at the site of and in
connection with the activity where the ex-
traordinary nuclear occurrence takes place
if benefits therefor are either payable or
required to be provided under an¥ workmen's
compensation or occupational disease law:

(¢) Any clalm for punitive or exemplary
damages, provided, with respect to any claim
for wrongful death under any State law
which provides for damages only punitive
in nature, this exclusion does not apply to
the extent that the claimant h-s sustained
actual damages, measured by the pecuniary
injuries resulting from such death but nct to
exceed the maximum amount otherwise re-
coverable under such law.

3. The walvers set forth in paragraph 1.
above shall be effective only with respect to
bodily injury or property damage to which
the policy applies under its terms other than

this endorsement: provided, however. that

with respect- to bodily injury or property

damage resulting {rom an extraordinary nu- -

clear occurrence, Insuring Agreement 1V,
«Application of Policr.” shall oot operate to
bar coverage for bodily injury or property
damage (a) which is caused during the
poticy period by the nuclear energy hazard
and (b) which'is discovered and for which
written claim is made againsd the insured
not later than twenty (20) vears after.the
date of the extraordinary nuclear occurrence.

Such waivers shall not apply o, or preju-
dise the prosecution or defense of any claim
or portion of ciaim which is neot within the
protection affurdad under

{a) The provisions of the poticy appii-
cabie to the financial protection requiz 2d of
the named insured:

(hy The azreement of indemnification be-
rapen the named insured and the Nuclear
Reroulatory Comimission made pursuant to
waction 170 of the Atomic Energy Act of 1054
as amanded: and ‘

(e)y The limit of liability provi
seetion 170e. of the Atomic Fueryy Act of
1954, as amended.

Such waivers shull not prectude a defense
based upon the fsilure of the claimant to

REGISTER, VOL. 42, NO. 73—MONDAY, APRIL

ons of Sub- |

take reasonable steps to mitigate damazes.

4. Subject to all of the umitations statzd
4n this endorsement and In .the Atcmis
Energy Act of 1954, as amended, the wo
set forth in paracraph 1. above shall be )t
clally enforceable in accordance with thzir
terms acainst any insured in an action 0
recover damages because of bodily inju
property damage to wkich the policy a
as proof of fnancial nrotection.

5. As used herein:

“Extraordinary nuelear occurrence’’
an event wiich the Nuclear Reguis
mission has determined to be an e
nary ntclear occurrence as defl
Atomic Energy Act of 1954, as amat

“Pinancial protection” and “nu
cent” have tite meanings given tirm in
‘Atomic Enerar Act of 1954 as amendod.

“Claimant” means the person or
tion actually susinining the bodilv i
rroperty damoaze and also inclvdes h
signees, lecal representatives and other 137
sons or organizations entltled to brinz 21
action for damages on account of such inl77
or damage. .

Erective date of this
____________________ to fcrma nart of 3

12:01 AM. Standard .

v
endargemant

Time
NO. ccccmeeomm e
-Issued to
Date of issue .
Endorsement NO. cccaceeaas —
For tie subscribing companies:
BY ccsemmmc e

. General Manager
Countersigned by _locccmcmecnnamoon- -

SUPPLEMENTARY ENDORSE?.!E;'T
WAIVER OF DEFENSES

ReacToR CONSTRUCTION AT THE Faciitt

It is azreed that in construing the appli-
cation of paragraph 2.(b) of the Wal of
Defenses Endorsement (NE-33a) with reizact
to an extraordirary muclear occurrenc? oC~
curring at the facility. a claimant who i3
employed at the facility in connection with
the construction of a nuclear reactor with
respect to which no operating license ras
been issued by the Nuclear Regulatory Com-
mission shall not be considered as emplorad
in, connection with the activity where the
extrzordinary nuclear occurrence takes riace

(1) The claimant is emploved exc! wely
in connection with the construction of a
puclear reactor. including all related equip-
ment and installations at the fzeilitr. and

(2) No operating license has been
hy the Nuclear Regulatory Commission with
respect to the nuclear reactdr, and -

(3)  The ciaimant 1s not emploved in ¢on-
nection with the possession, stor=ge. ufe or
transfer of nuclear material at the fa2il

wective date of this endorsen
_______ ot -fo--—.toforma partols?

Time

Date Of iSSUL cmecemmmemm=o
Prdorsemant NOoooaoano-—-
For the subscribing companies:

General o b

Countorsigned DY e amamcammmmasme ot

NUCLRAR ENERGY LIARITITY
(FACILITY FORM

DEFINITION  OF
{InpeMN

AMUMNOMENT  OF
Exepay - llazarp”
FaciiTy)

It is woreed thatt L
to an “insured shipnient” o wi
policy applies as prool of financial -

Kotewy wiil

18, 1977




- portation,

- vided ibhat the nuclear

' tlon requirec by the Nuclear Regulatory

Commission, subkdivision (2) of the defin:-

" tion of ‘muclear energy lnzard” is amended
‘toread:

(2)"The nuclear material is in an insured

“shiprent which iIs away from any other nu-

clear facility and is in the course of trans-
including handling and tcmpo-
rary storage incidental thereto, within
‘ (a) The territorial limits of the Unifed
States ‘of America, its territories or posses-
sions, Puerto Rico or the Canal Zone; or

(b) International waters or airspace, pro-
material is in the
course of transportation between two points

‘located within the territorial limits described

in (a) above and there are no deviations in
the course of the transportation for the pur-
pose of going to any other country, state or
nation, except a deviation in the course of
said transportation for ilie purpose of going
to or roturning from o port or place of ref-
uge as the result of -an. cniergency.

2. As used herein. “financial protection™
has the meaning given it in the Atomic

© Energy Act of 1954, as amended.

. N'UCLE"SR ENERGY

-

.were issued

A}\!ENDMENT OF DEFINITIONS OF

‘vided that the nuclesr
.course of transporiation between two points

. source

- InstTRUCTIONS—'This form is to be used to
modify all Nuclear Energy Liabillty Facility
Forms in force on January 1, 1977 which
to  hecome effective prior lo
January 1, 1977 and which are offered by the

- named insured as proof of financial protec-
. tlon being- maintained as reguired by the

Atomic Energy Act of 1854, os amended.
Efrectlve date of this Endorsement ...._
! To form a part of

12:01 A'M. Standard Tiine

,policy No. oo

Issued to...._ - :

Date 6f 3580€ e onme e :

Endorsement No
- For the subscribing companies:
’ B

General Man'xger -
Countcx sxgncd Y e v e
LIABILITY POLICY

[TUA MTT T YRATIRAN
; FE RO BIL AN SO DEB i

“NUCLEAR
Emzml:r HAZARD” AxD “INSURED SHIPMENT"
(Imn"\ux F1ED NUCLEAR F'ACILITY)

It is f*pxeed that: L In Insuring Agrecment
L' DEII‘INITIOIV“"
A. %1e1y with respect to an “insured ship-

.ment” to which this policy applies as proof

of financial protection required by the Nu-
clear Regulatmy Commission, Subdivision
{(2) of” the definition of “nuclear energy haz-

_ard” is amevded to read:

(2) The nucleal material is in an 1nsulcd
shxpment which is away from any other
nuclear facility and is in the course of trans-
portation, including the handling and tem-

' porary storage incidental {hereto, within

(&) The territorial limifs of the United

States of Amenca, its tn'utoues or posses-
.glons, Puerto Ricotor

(b) International waters or airspace, pro-
material is in the

located within the territorial limits described
in (a) above and there are no deviations in
the course of the tronsportation for the pur-
pose of going to any cther country, state or
nation, except for a deviation in the course
of said transportation for the purpose of

going 1o or returning frm a port or place of

refuge as the result of an emergency.
B. The definition of “insured shlpment” i

.’replaced with the following:

“Insured shipment” means a shipment of
material, special nuclear material,
spent fiel or waste, herein called “material”,
(1) to the facility from any location except
[N mdcmmﬁed nuclear facility, but only if
the tranbportatlon of the material is not by
predetermination 1o be interrupted by re-

FEDERAL

- .V . ‘ .
- 3

RULES AND REGULATIONS

moval of the material from a transporting
conveyance for any purpose other than the
continuation of its transportation, or (2)
irom the facility to any other location, but
only until the material is removed from a

transporting conveyance .for any purpose’

other than the contlinuation of its transpor-
tation.

II. As used herein, “ﬁna.ncial protection
hes the meaning given it in the Atomic
Energy Act of 1954, as amended.

InsTrUCTIONS.—This form is to be used to
modify all Nuclear Energy Liability Facility
Forms which are Issued to become effective
on or after January 1, 1877 and which are
offered by the named insured as proof of

financial protection being maintained as re- -

quired by the Atomic Energy Act of 1954, as

amended. ,
Eﬁectxve date of this endorsement -l..--

________________________ To form a part of

12:01 a.m. standard time

policy No. —______
Issued to ______

. By SO S
© - i General Manager
Countersigned DY e iommomaaon .
§140.92 [Amended]

' 7. Section 140.92, Appendix B, Article I,
the. prefatory language of paragraph 5
is amended to read as follows:

" . “In the course of transportation” means in
the course ‘of transportation within the

United States, or in the course of transporta-’
* tion outside the United States and any other

nation, 'including handling or temporary
storage incidental thereto, of the radioactive
material to the location or from the location
provided that: o

© 8. Section 140.92, Appendlx B ‘Article
1i, paragraph 4(c) is amended by chang-
ing “ten years” to “20 years.”

9. Section 140.92, Appendix B, Article
II, paragraph 8(a), is amended by delet-
ing the amount “$96,875,000” wherever
it appears and substituting therefor
“$108,500,000.”

10. Section 140.92, Appendix B, Article
II, paragraph 8(b), is amended by delet-
ing the amount “$28 125,000” wherever
it appears and substituting therefor
“$31,500,000.”

11. Section 140.92, Appendix B Article
II, paragraph 8(c), is amended by
changing the amount “$125,000,000” to
“ar amount equal to the sum of $140,-
000,000 and the amount available as
secondary financial protection.”

12 Seciion 140.52, Appendix B. Article
111, paragraph 4(b) (2), is amended by
changing “$125,000,000” to “an amount
equal to the sum of $140,000,000 and the
amount available as secondaxy ﬁnanCIal
pxotectlon

14093 [Amended]

13. Section 140.93, Appendix C, Article
I, the prefatory language of paragraph
.5 is amended to read as follows:

“In the course of transportation” means

in the course of transportation within the

United States, or in the course of transpor-
tation outside the  United States and any
other nation, including handiing or tempo-
rary storage incidental thereto, of the radio-
active material to the location or from the

location provided that:

REGISTER, VOL. 42, NO. 74—MONDAY, APRIL 18, 1977

20141

- 14. Section 140.93, Appendix C, Article .
O, paragraph 4(c), is amended by
changing “10 years” to “20 years.”

15. Section 140.93, Appendix C, Article

-II, paragraph 8, is amended by changing

the amount. “$125,000,000” -to *“an
amount equal to the sum of $140,000,000
and the amount available as secondary
financial protection.”

16. Section 140.93. Appendix C, Article
III, paragraph 4(b)(2), is amended by
changing “$125,000,000” to “an amount
equal to the sum of $140,000,000 and the
amount ava.xlable as secondary ﬁnancxal
protection.”

§ 140.94 [Anu.ndcd]

17. Section 140.94, Appendix D, Artxcle'
I, the prefatory language of paragraph
4, is amended to read as follows:

-"In the course of transportation” means in

‘the course of transportation. within the
.. United States, or in the course of transporta-
"- tion outside the United States and any other

nation, including handling or temporary
storage incidential thereto, of the radioactive’

.material to the location or from the location
- provided that:

18. Section- 140.94, Appendxx D, A1—
ticle II, paragraph 4(c), is amended by
changing “10 years” to “20 years.”

"19. Section 140.94, Appendix D, Ar-
ticle II, paragraph 6, is amended by
changing *“$125,000,000” to “an amount
equal to the sum of $140,000,000 and the
amount available as secondazy ﬁnanc1a1
protection.”

§ 140.95 [Amended]

20. Section 140.95, Appendix E Ar-
ticle I, the prefatory language of para-
giaph 4, 5 ainended Lo read as ICHOWs!

“In. the course of transportation” means
in the course of transportation within the
United States, or in the course of transpor-
tation outside the United States and any
other nation, including handling or tem-
porary storage incidental thereto, of the
radioactive material to the location oF from
the -location provided that:

21. Section 140.95, Appendix E, Ar-
ticle II, paragraph 2(c), is amended by
changing “10 years” to 20 years.” ]

22. Section 140.95, Appendix E, Article
III, paragraph 4(b) (2), is amended by
changing “$125,000,000” to “an amount
equal to the sum of $140,000,000 and the.
amount avaxlable as secondary financial -
protection.” + « . s

8 140.]07 [Amended] )
23. Section 140.107, Appendix G, Arti-

cle I, the prefatory language of para-
graph 4, is amended to read as follows:

".*“In the course of transportation” means

in the course of transportation within the
United States. or in the course of transpor-
tation outside the United States and any
other nation, including handling or tempo-
rary storage incidental thereto, of the radio-
active material to the location or from the lo-
cation provided that:

24. Section 140.107, Appendix G, Ar-
ticle 1I, paragraph 6(a), is amended by
deleting the amount “$96,875,000” wher-
ever it appears and substitutmg therexor
“$108,500,000.”



20142

25. Section 140.107, Appendix G, Ar-
titicle II, paragraph 6(b), is amended by
deleting the amount “$28,125,000"" wher-

- ever it appears and substituting therefor

“$31,508,000.”

26. Section 140.107, Appendlx G, Arti--
cle II, paragraph 6(c),
changing the amount “$125 000,000 to

-¢“gn amount equal to the sum of $140,-

000,000 and the amount available as
secondary financial protection.”
97. Section 140.107, Appendix G, Ar-

“"ticle III, paragraph 4(b), is amended by

changing the amount ¢125 000,000 Lo
“$140,000,000.”

§ 140.108 [Amended] ‘ —

28. Section 140.108, Appendix H, Ar-
ticle I, the prfeatory language of para-

eraph 4, is amended to read as follows:

"In the course of transportation” means in
the course of transportation within the

is amended by

RU!.ES AND REGU!ATIONS

‘Unlted Dti\tus, or in the course -of tmn.spor-
tation outs;do the United States and any

other nation, Including handllng or tem- -

‘porary storage incidental thereto, of the ra-
dioactive material to the location or fxom the
location provndcd that:

29. Section 140.108, Appendix H Ar-
ticle II, paragraph 6(a), is amended by
deleting the amount “$96,875,000”
wherever it -appears anu substituting
therefor “$108, 500,000.”

30. ‘Section 140.108, Al)pnndn: H, Ar-
ticle 11, paragraph 6(%), is amended by
deléting the amount “$28,125,000” wher-
ever it appears and s,ubstxtutmg thexef01
“$31,500,000.”

31. Section 140.108, Appendix H Ar-
ticle II, paragraph 6(c), is amended: by
changing the amount “$125,000,000” to
“an amount equal to the sum of $140,-
000.000 and the amount available as sec-
ondary financial protection...

FEDERAL REGISTER, VOL 42, NO. f{—MONDA‘!. APRIL 18, 1977

32. Section 140.108, Appendix, X, Arti-
cle III, varagraph 4¢(h), is amended by
changing the amount “$125, 000 00067 to
“$140, 000 000.” N

Effective date: The foregoing ammd-
ments become effective on May 1,.1977,, ...
(See. 161, Pub. Law 83-703, €8 Stat. 948 (42
U.S.C. 2201); sec. 170, Pub. Law 85-256, 71
Stat. 576, Pub. Law 94--197, 89 Stat. 1111 (42
U.S.C. 2210); sec.::201, Pub. Law '93-438, as
amended, 88 Stat. 1242, 69 Stat. 415 (42 Us.C.
5841).)

Dated at Washington, D.C,, thlo 14th
day of April 1977, .

For the Nuclear Regulatory Commis-
sion. - -

SamueL J. CHILK,
Secretary of the Commission,
- [FR Doc.77-11340 Filed 4-15-77;8:45 am]




